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The choice for the most suitable type of 

enterprise for a commercial undertak-

ing in Switzerland is of great impor-

tance. Regarding liability and taxes, 

limited liability companies will be on 

the fore, at present as well as after the 

current amendments. 

 

On taking up a commercial activity in Swit-
zerland, the question arises what the ideal 
type of enterprise would be respectively 
which legal form would best meet the finan-
cial, legal and fiscal concerns of the foreign 
investor. The following is a short and simpli-
fied description of the criteria for this choice 
and the particularities of each of the dif-
ferent types of enterprises under Swiss law. 
 
I. Criteria for choosing a type of enter-

prise 

 

There are three criteria that are on the fore 
when deciding on a type of enterprise, 
namely: 
 
1. Equity requirements (as a financial crite-

rion) 

Next to the basic considerations on the capi-
tal requirements, that vary according to the 
size and business model, there are differ-
rences in the minimum capitalisation and 
the costs of the establishment of the under-
taking. For joint stock companies and limited 

liability companies these costs are slightly 
higher than for the other types of enterprise, 
as their establishment will need to be pu-
blicly registered. 
 
2. Liability (as a legal criterion) 

Depending on the choice for a certain type 
of enterprise, the participating (natural) 
persons will be held personally liable with 
his whole personal property, or the liability 
is limited to the value of the assets of the 
company. 
 
3. Tax burden (as a economical criterion) 

The tax burden on the different types of 
enterprise does not only vary in rate but 
also in the way the taxes are imposed: 
 
- Private companies (individual enterprises 
and partnerships respectively limited part-
nerships) will have no taxes imposed on 
them directly, but the income and capital of 
the company will be taxed indirectly through 
the owner, together with the taxation of the 
rest of his income and capital. Additionally, 
the contributions for the social funds are to 
be paid on the income of the company. Re-
turn on capital out of divestiture and liquida-
tion of assets are regarded as part of the 
taxable income; that means that on the sale 
of the undertaking, also the hidden reserves 
will be subject to taxation. 
 
- Stock corporations (joint stock companies 
and limited liability companies) will be 
autonomously charged with a tax. The di-
vestiture of stocks respectively of shares is 
of no influence on the taxation of the com-
pany. Additionally, in some of the cantons 
the shareholder does not have to pay taxes 
on the sales profit of his shares. The share-
holder privately pays taxes on his income 
from the company and on the share of capi-
tal he has in the company. It is true that 
economically this results in a double taxa-
tion of profit distribution, as tax on corpo-
rate profits will be firstly imposed on the 
undertaking and after distribution of the 
profit for a second time, but now on the 
shareholder. Tax reforms in some of the 
cantons have alleviated this double taxation 
and also on federal level some mitigations 
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are being planned. 

 
Not the distributed profit, but the tax-
effective costs form the salaries and hono-
raria of the shareholder, on which income 
taxation will be imposed. Concerning the tax 
burden one has to say that the Swiss tax 
rates are moderate, compared to other na-
tional tax rates; however, the tax rates may 
also vary from canton to canton. 
 
 
II. Possible legal forms 

 

Swiss law knows several types of enterprises. 
For foreign investors, the ones that stand to 
the fore are: 
- individual enterprises (one-man busi-

nesses) 
- partnerships and limited partnerships 
- limited liability companies 
- joint stock companies 
 
For several reasons, normally the limited joint 
stock company, the cooperative and the unin-
corporated association are coming into con-
sideration. 
 
 
III. Special features of the selected legal 

forms 

 
1. Individual enterprise (one-man business) 

The individual enterprise does not require a 
minimum capital nor a formal act of forma-
tion, it comes into being with the proprietor 
taking on the business activity. Entry in the 
Commercial Registry is only mandatory, when 
the annual turnover is more than  
CHF 100'000.00. The proprietor or an author-
ized representative must reside in Switzer-
land. 
 
The most important disadvantage of the indi-
vidual enterprise is the unlimited liability of 
the proprietor for the obligations of the en-
terprise. 
 
2. Partnership 

The partnership comes to life with the conclu-
sion of the Articles of Partnership, and should 
be entered in the Commercial Registry under 
the name of the partners. At least one of the 
persons that are authorized representatives 
must reside in Switzerland. 
 
The most important disadvantage is that the 
partners are jointly and unlimitedly liable for 
the obligations of the enterprise in case the 
partnership is unsuccessful or liquidated or in 
case of bankruptcy of one of the partners. 

3. Limited partnership 

The limited partnership has much in common 
with the partnership, with the difference that 
the partners can limit the personal liability to 
a certain amount. However, at least one of 
the partners has to be unlimitedly liable. For 
the rest we refer to the partnership. 
 
4. Limited liability company 

The law concerning the limited liability com-
pany faces a revision, that will only come into 
force in January 2008. Below follows an out-
line of the applicable law and additionally the 
future rules between brackets. 
 
For the formation of a limited liability com-
pany one needs at least two natural persons 
or companies (new: a person respectively a 
company). The names of the partners are 
entered in the Commercial Registry and are 
therefore outwardly apparent. Mandatory is a 
minimum capital of CHF 20'000.00, of which 
at least 50% has to be deposited (new: full 
deposit). The maximum capital is CHF 
2'000'000.00 (new: no maximum capital). 
Only the company is liable for the obligations 
of the company vis-à-vis third parties, –
provided that the company capital has been 
fully deposited) – a personal liability for the 
partners does not exist. The organs of the 
company with limited liability are the Part-
ners’ Meeting and the Management Board, of 
which at least the executive director must 
reside in Switzerland (new: an authorized 
representative must reside in Switzerland). 
An audit division is not compulsory (new: an 
audit division is compulsory, whereas if cer-
tain conditions are fulfilled, the company can 
do without such an audit division). 
 

5. Joint stock company 

The stock corporation law has also faced a 
revision, which is expected to come into force 
together with the law concerning the limited 
liability company (the text between brackets 
refers to the new legal situation). 
 
The minimum number of natural persons or 
companies (new: a person respectively a 
company) required for the formation of a joint 
stock company is three. The names of the 
stockholders are not entered in the Commer-
cial Registry. The company will have to keep 
account of the names of the stockholders only 
when using registered stocks. When using 
bearer stocks, the one who can identify him-
self by ownership of the stock is considered to 
be stockholder – therefore, the French des-
cription of the joint stock company (‘Société 
Anonyme’) is most effective in case of bearer 
shares. The minimum capital of the joint 
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stock company is CHF 100'000.00 of which at 
least 20% – with a minimum of  
CHF 50'000.00 has to be deposited. A per-
sonal liability of the partners for the obliga-
tions of the company is precluded – provided 
that the company capital has been fully de-
posited. The organs of the company are the 
General Meeting, the Board of Directors and 
the audit division (new: the audit division can 
be left out if certain conditions are fulfilled). 
The majority of the Board of Directors must 
consist of Swiss citizens or citizens from the 
EU or EFTA who reside in Switzerland (new: 
an authorized representative must reside in 
Switzerland). 
 
 
IV. Digression: Establishing a branch in 

Switzerland 

 

A foreign business can also take up a com-
mercial activity in Switzerland by establishing 
a branch, that must be entered in the Com-
mercial Registry. At least one of the autho-
rized representatives for the branch must 
reside in Switzerland. A basic capital is not 
necessary for the formation of a branch, as 
the branch only mirrors the head office. 
Therefore, a self-contained Swiss legal per-
sonality is not accorded to the branch. The 
most important disadvantage is the subsidi-
ary liability of the foreign head office for the 
obligations of the Swiss branch. Concerning 
taxations, the profits and assets of the Swiss 
branch fall under Swiss taxation, after which 
a separation of taxes with the foreign head 
office follows. Several agreements on double 

taxation – for example with Germany – make 
the profit, generated in Switzerland, ex-
empted from taxation in the state of the head 
office. In case the profit will be distributed 
solely to the head office, the Swiss clearing 
tax of 35% will not be incurred.  
 
 
V. Conclusion 

 

When a foreign investor wants to establish an 
independent enterprise in Switzerland, the 
choice for a certain type of enterprise will 
mainly focus on the joint stock company and 
the limited liability company. These types of 
enterprises namely do not result in personal 
liability of the partners for obligations of the 
company. Which of these two types cor-
responds most with the needs of the enter-
prise depends on the concrete circumstances 
of the case. The problem of double taxation of 
profit distribution can be tackled by adequate 
tax planning. By combining their expertise, 
professionals like notaries and tax consultants 
will be able to support foreign investors in 
making a choice for the ideal type of enter-
prise for their business in Switzerland.         � 
 
 
This article is the translated version of the article 
"Wahl der Unternehmensform nach schweizeri-
schem Recht, unter Berücksichtigung von steuerli-
chen Aspekten" as published in CH-D Wirtschaft 
5/2007 


